MONTSERRAT

STATUTORY RULES AND ORDERS

S.R.O. 7 OF 2022

SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFITS) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS
2022

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS

1011 - 1[0 S
Regulation 27 amended...........oooviiiniininie e
Regulation 31 amended...........cccooveiieiieii e




Montserrat
Social Security (Benefits) (Amendment) Regulations 2022
S.R.0. 7 of 2022

MONTSERRAT

STATUTORY RULES AND ORDERS

S.R.O. 7 OF 2022

SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFITS) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS
2022

THE SOCIAL SECURITY (BENEFITS) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2022 MADE BY THE GOVERNOR ACTING ON THE
ADVICE OF CABINET, AFTER CONSULTATION WITH THE
SOCIAL SECURITY BOARD, UNDER SECTIONSs 33 AND 50 OF THE
SOCIAL SECURITY ACT (CAP. 18.09).

1 Citation
These Regulations may be cited as the Social Security (Benefits)
(Amendment) Regulations 2022,

2 Regulation 27 amended

Regulation 27(4) of the Social Security (Benefits) Regulations
(S.R.O. 24 of 1987) is amended in the chapeau by deleting “60%”
and substituting “55%”.

3 Regulation 31 amended

Regulation 31 of the Social Security (Benefits) Regulations
(S.R.O. 24 of 1987) is amended—

(@) in subregulation (1), in the proviso, by deleting “60%” and
substituting “55%"; and

(b) in subregulation (3), by deleting “three” and inserting
“seven”.




Montserrat
Social Security (Benefits) (Amendment) Regulations 2022
S.R.0. 7 of 2022

Made by the Governor acting on the advice of Cabinet after consultation with the
Social Security Board this 27th day of January, 2022.

(Sgd.) Marjorie Smith
Clerk of Cabinet

Published by exhibition by the Clerk of Cabinet at the Office of the Legislature,
Farara Plaza, Brades, Montserrat, MSR1110, this 4" day of February, 2022.

(Sgd.) Marjorie Smith
Clerk of Cabinet




